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(Synaphobranchidae) found in the Zenklava Formation 
(Na Pasekach Section, Subsilesian Unit) are the first fossil 
finds o f this family.
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Biotic traces in invertebrate fossils are of special interest to 
paleontologists since it provides important clue to under­
stand the evolution of biotic interaction through time. The 
two main types of biotic interaction that has a negative 
effect on one of the participating group are predation and 
parasitism. While record of predation is rare, record of 
drilling predation often get preserved in the fossils and 
therefore studied by paleobiologists. The most common 
reports of occurrence of such predation are from Recent 
and fossil molluscs. It has been claimed that during 
Cenozoic, molluscs became the main targeted prey and 
hence other invertebrate taxa virtually escaped the drilling 
predation. However, the incidence of drilling predation 
in other non-molluscan prey taxa from Cenozoic is criti­
cal to evaluate this claim. Here we are reporting various 
biotic traces including predatory drillholes from a non- 
molluscan group, foraminifera of Eocene time.
We have observed various biotic traces in the larger 
benthic foraminifera of Eocene age from Kutch, West­
ern India. The biotic traces found in the foraminifera 
population are mainly of two types, predatory drill holes 
and substrate boring. Both of the traces are highly non- 
random in terms of species and size selectivity. Out of six 
main foraminifera species found in that Eocene strata, 
two are particularly common, namely Nummulites obtusus 
and Discocyclina sowerbyi. Out of these two predominant 
groups, TV. obtusus is quite heavily preyed upon (18 %) 
where as the other group is virtually unaffected (1.1%) by 
predation. Among TV. obtusus population the larger size 
class has the highest incidence of predation. The position

of the predatory drill holes is distributed non-randomly 
and indicative o f stereotypic behavior of the predator. 
After observing drilled pattern, we suggest that the drill­
ing predator is probably juvenile naticid gastropods. The 
reason behind the prey preference is most likely the rela­
tive difficulty in handling the saddle shaped Discocyclina 
sow erbyi prior to drilling. In contrast, TV. obtusus has a very 
smooth disc shape that makes it easy victim of drilling 
attacks. Similar preference is observed for substrate bor­
ings, where its presence is nonexistent in D. sow erbyi in 
contrast to a 28% occurrence in TV. obtusus. This difference, 
although hard to explain, could be related to the difference 
in available symbiotic algae in the surface of the tests of 
different species. Often the substrate borers target the 
symbiotic algae of the foraminifera test and preferential 
abundance of these algal populations in some groups 
could make them more attractive for the substrate borers.
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The 18 m thick Adelholzen Section, located southwest 
of Siegsdorf in southern Bavaria, Germany is part of the 
Helvetic (tectonic) Unit and comprises six lithologic units:
1) marly, glauconitic sands with predominantly Assilina,
2) marly bioclastic sands with predominantly Nummulites,
3) glauconitic sands, 4) marls with Discocyclina, 5) marly 
brown sand (units 1-5 „Adelholzener Schichten“ or Kres- 
senberg Formation), and 6) Stockletten (marls w ith o u t 

established formal name).
The Adelholzen-Section is rich in planktic foraminifera’ 
Reworked specimens from older deposits commonly oc 
cur, whereas most zonal markers were not found within 
the investigated samples; other potential index specie5 
show a rather sporadic occurrence instead of a continuous 
record. Consequently, our age model is based mainly OIj 
calcareous nannofossils and nummulitids and one z°n‘
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